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Docs & Packets
Paper Traveler

The old Shop Floor Paper Traveler
contained documents, files, quality 
instructions, manufacturing 
instructions and included a set of 
sequential work process that were 
used to manufacture a part.

Operation

The Traveler contained paper work 
that detailed the various individual 
processes (operations) that were to 
be followed in order to manufacture 
the part to the drawing and 
specifications.

Approval of Processes

These processes were usually 
approved by Quality Engineering,
Manufacturing Engineering and 
Manufacturing.

In-Production Changes

Whenever there were changes to an 
operation it became a real hassle to 
modify/replace these paper 

operations on the shop floor.

Packets are the Solution

SuiteFactory's Packet provides all of 
the benefits of the paper traveler 
without any of the hassles by
providing single point of control for 
modifications and approval.

Packet File Categories

SuiteFactory's Packets provide three 
categories for all of you file types: 
DNC; Controlled Documents and 
Uncontrolled Documents.

ISO9000 Protection

DNC files and Controlled 
Documents are maintained in 
SuiteFactory's Database so you can 
provide ISO9000 control and
protection.
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Document & File Approval
Packet Approval Structure

SuiteFactory's Packets provides the 
User the ability to approve any 
document or file from within the 
Packet itself placing these into the
appropriate categories for easy 
selection and approval. See below 
for Visual.

The Packet View
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